
Line Item Description

4.10.1 Strike Body Only, 12/24VDC, Fail Secure
Brand Reference: HES 1006 or Equal

$345.27
HE-1006-F-630	1006 Series Electric Strike 
Body Only x Fail Safe

$365.00
HES  1006-630

4.10.2 Genesis Exit Devide Electric Strike
Brand Reference: HES 9600 or Equal

351.03
HE-9600-630	Electric Strike for Rim Mount 
Exit Devices

$294.00
HES 9600-630

4.10.3
Electric Strike Body, 12/24 AC/VDC, Fail-
safe/FAI

$142.93
HE-520010401	Electric Strike Body, 12/24VDC, 
.24/.12A, 1-3/16"

$107.00
HES 5200-630

4.10.4

Electromechanical Automatic 
Deadlocking Latch, Electric 24 VDC 
Solenoid Power, and Manual Key 
Unlocking
Brand Reference: Brinks 3020 Series or 
Equal

No Bid $1,950.00
BRINKS 3026

4.10.5
Morise Lock
Brand Reference: 45H Best Brand or 
Equal

$1,437.65
45HWCADEL626RQEFail Safe 24V Electrified 
Mortise Lock

$680.00
BEST 45H7AB-14J-626

4.10.5 
Alternative 1

Morise Lock
Brand Reference: 45H Best Brand or 
Equal

$652.37
45HWCADEL626RQEFail Safe 24V Electrified 
Mortise Lock

4.10.5 
Alternative 2

Morise Lock
Brand Reference: 45H Best Brand or 
Equal

$2,672.31
BES45HW-7-DEU-17-R-626RQEElectro-
Mechanical Mortise DEU Electronic Unlock

4.10.5 
Alternative 3

Morise Lock
Brand Reference: 45H Best Brand or 
Equal

$1,328.34
BES45HW-7-DEU-17R-630-RQEBest 45 7 pin 
satin Stainless Steel Electrified

4.10.6 Solenoid Fail Safe
Brand Reference: Folger Adam or Equal No Bid $100.00

FOLGER ELECTRIC 076-0122-003

4.10.7 AC Plug-in Bridge Rectifier
Brand Reference: HES 2001M or Equal No Bid $43.00

HES 2001M

4.10.8
Heavy Duty Door Closer
Brand Reference: LCN 4040xp-cush-al-
sri or Equal

No Bid $490.00
LCN 4040XP-Cush-AL-SRI

4.10.9
SFIC Core
Brand Reference: Best Lock  
1CCB7B911626 9K Series or Equal

No Bid $40.00
BEST 1CB7B91626

4.10.10
Entrance Cylindrical Lever Locks
Brand Reference Best 9K37AB15DS3626 
9K Series or Equal

No Bid $450.00
BEST 9K37AB15DS3626

4.10.11
Entry (Entrance/Office) Function
Brand Reference: Best Lock 
7KC37AB14DS3626 or Equal

No Bid $220.00
BEST 7KC37AB174DS3626

4.10.12
Dual Volt Magnalock Dual Volt
Brand Reference: Securitron M32 or 
Equal

$324.40
SN-M32	600 LB MAG W/DUAL VOLTAGE $230.00

SECURITRON M32

4.10.13

Electromechanical Maglock MM15 S
Brand Reference: Securitron MM15 or 
Equal No Bid $330.00

SECURITRON MM15

4.10.14
Deadlatch, 115AC1 Motor, K
Brand Reference: Southern Folger or 
Equal

No Bid $2,850.00
SOUTHERN STEEL  10300M-2

4.10.15

Firm, Fixed Discount off the current 
contractor catalog price or MSRP, 
whichever is less, for other security 
hardware and locksmith supplies not 
specifically identified in the previous line 
items. 
Provide catalog, price list, and/or website 
URL

all pricing for items not specified will be 
actual cost plus 30% plus shipping. 50%

4.10.16.1 Maximum % Increase 1st Contract Renewal 
Term: 3% 10%

4.10.16.2 Maximum % Increase 2nd Contract Renewal 
Term:  3% 10%

4.10.16.3 Maximum % Increase 3rd Contract Renewal 
Term:  3% 10%

4.10.16.4 Maximum % Increase 4th Contract Renewal 
Term: 3% 10%

COOP ? (YES OR NO) Yes Yes

35-09DEC25 - Security Hardware and Locksmith Supplies - Term and 
Bidders:

Midwest Alarm Services Craftmaster Hardware LLC
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